
Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM Price UOM
HMA Pavement:  3 LT, 58-28, S $55.45 TON $54.50 TON $51.25 TON
HMA Pavement:  4 LT, 58-28, S $57.00 TON $55.50 TON $52.25 TON
HMA Pavement:  5 LT, 58-28, S $58.55 TON $56.50 TON $54.00 TON
HMA Pavement:  3 MT, 58-28, S $55.45 TON $56.50 TON $51.85 TON
HMA Pavement:  4 MT, 58-28, S $57.00 TON $57.50 TON $52.85 TON
HMA Pavement:  5 MT, 58-28, S $58.55 TON $58.50 TON $54.60 TON
HMA Pavement:  3 MT, 58-28, H $61.70 TON $58.50 TON
HMA Pavement:  4 MT, 58-28, H $63.25 TON $59.50 TON
HMA Pavement:  5 MT, 58-28, H $64.80 TON $61.50 TON
HMA Pavement:  3 HT, 58-28, H $67.95 TON $67.50 TON
HMA Pavement:  4 HT, 58-28, H $69.40 TON $67.50 TON
HMA Pavement:  5 HT, 58-28, H $67.50 TON

Asphaltic Prime or Tack Coat $10.00 GAL $10.00 GAL

Add'l charge per ton for material picked-up 
7pm - 1 am

Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered

Cold Mix (Summer Patch) – Madison Shop No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.95 $110.95

Cold Mix (Winter Patch) –Madison Shop No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.95 $110.95
Cold Mix Special – Madison Shop* $125.00 $135.00 No Bid $110.00 No Bid No Bid $105.95 $115.95
Cold Mix Special – Badger Salt Shed* $125.00 $135.00 No Bid $108.00 No Bid No Bid $105.95 $115.95
Cold Mix Special – East Side Facility* $125.00 $135.00 No Bid $109.00 No Bid No Bid $105.95 $115.95
Cold Mix Special – Stoughton Shop* $125.00 $135.00 No Bid $111.00 No Bid No Bid $105.95 $115.95
Cold Mix Special – Springfield Shop* $125.00 $135.00 No Bid $110.00 No Bid No Bid $105.95 $115.95
Cold Mix Special – Mount Horeb Shop* $125.00 $135.00 No Bid $113.00 No Bid No Bid $105.95 $120.95
Delivery Days ARO

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$2,100/Night No Bid $2,500 N/A

N/A

Vendor Name: Payne & Dolan Blackstone

BID SUMMARY
BID #: 118003

Asphaltic Concrete Product
2/8/2018

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

608-266-4131
www.danepurchasing.com

Tri-County Wolf Paving

COLD MIX (PER TON)

HOT MIX

Two Days One Day One Day

$4.75/GAL
$50.25/5GAL

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid


	All Vendors

