BID SUMMARY

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

608.266.4131 Bid #119009 Seed, Sod, Topsoil
www.danepurchasing.com 2/2 1/20 19
Vendor: LaCrosse Seed Deer Creek Seed Keleny Top Soil
Local Vendor Preference Locally Operated Locally Operated Locally Based & Owned
Local Content Preference Dane County-Made Dane County-Made Dane County-Made
Cooperative Purchasing Yes Yes No
eed & Fe e Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered
eed 0# bag (per pound) (per pound) (per pound) (per pound) (per pound) (per pound) (per pound) (per pound)
1 WisDOT Mixture #10 $2.05 $2.05 $1.93 $1.98 No Bid No Bid
2 WisDOT Mixture #20 $1.64 $1.64 $1.49 $1.54 No Bid No Bid
3 WisDOT Mixture #30 $1.90 $1.90 $1.80 $1.85 No Bid No Bid
4 WisDOT Mixture #40 $1.80 $1.80 $1.69 $1.74 No Bid No Bid
5 WisDOT Mixture #60 $1.98 $1.98 $1.98 $2.03 No Bid No Bid
6 Fertilizer, Type A $13.35/bag $13.35/bag $0.25 $0.28 No Bid No Bid
7 Fertilizer, Type B $16.45 / bag $16.45 / bag $0.28 $0.31 No Bid No Bid
8 Terrace Sun Mix $1.89 $1.89 $2.12 $2.17 No Bid No Bid
9 Terrace Shade Mix $2.30 $2.30 $1.58 $1.63 No Bid No Bid
10 Winter Rye $0.26 $0.26 $0.22 $0.27 No Bid No Bid
11 Winter Wheat $0.25 $0.25 $0.22 $0.27 No Bid No Bid
# Seed & Fertilizer Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered
(Seed in 50# bags) (per SY) (per SY) (per SY) (per SY) (per SY) (per SY) (per SY) (per SY)
12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
# Topsoil Price Loaded Pl_r:)c;dlglgt Price Loaded Pl_r:)c;dlglgt Price Loaded Pl_r:)c;dlglgt Price Loaded Pl_r:)c;dlglgt
Ton CY Ton CY Ton CY Ton CY Ton CY Ton CY Ton CY Ton CY
17 Shredded No Bid No Bid $22.00 $25.00
18 Not Shredded No Bid No Bid $17.50 $20.75
19 Construction Grade Dirt No Bid No Bid $5.00 $10.00
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