
UOM
1 HMA Pavement:  3 LT, 58-28, S TON
2 HMA Pavement:  4 LT, 58-28, S TON
3 HMA Pavement:  5 LT, 58-28, S TON
4 HMA Pavement:  3 MT, 58-28, S TON
5 HMA Pavement:  4 MT, 58-28, S TON
6 HMA Pavement:  5 MT, 58-28, S TON
7 HMA Pavement:  3 MT, 58-28, H TON
8 HMA Pavement:  4 MT, 58-28, H TON
9 HMA Pavement:  5 MT, 58-28, H TON

10 HMA Pavement:  3 HT, 58-28, H TON
11 HMA Pavement:  4 HT, 58-28, H TON
12 HMA Pavement:  5 HT, 58-28, H TON
13 Asphaltic Prime or Tack Coat GAL

14 Additional charge per ton for material picked-up 
between 7 p.m. and 1 a.m. (special projects) NIGHT

UOM Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered
15 Cold Mix (Summer Patch) – Madison Shop TON No Bid No Bid $105.95 $116.95
16 Cold Mix (Winter Patch) – Madison Shop TON No Bid No Bid $105.95 $116.95

Cold Mix Special – Madison Shop*
QPR 2000 or approved equal
Equal:
Cold Mix Special – Badger Salt Shed *
QPR 2000 or approved equal
Equal:
Cold Mix Special – East Side Facility*
QPR 2000 or approved equal
Equal:
Cold Mix Special – Stoughton Shop*
QPR 2000 or approved equal
Equal:
Cold Mix Special – Springfield Shop*
QPR 2000 or approved equal
Equal:
Cold Mix Special – Mt. Horeb Shop*
QPR 2000 or approved equal
Equal:
Cold Mix Delivery (ARO) DAYS

UOM
23 TON
24 TON
25 TON
26 TON
27 TON

No Bid

TON

TON

TON

FOB Plant Picked Up

SUMMARY - BID# 119003 
Asphaltic Concrete Products
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Comments

Yes No YesCooperative Purchasing

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

608-266-4131
www.danepurchasing.com

VENDOR NAME Tri-County Paving Payne and Dolan
Fitchburg Plant

Wolf Paving

No

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

HOT MIX MATERIAL

COLD MIX MATERIAL

OTHER SPECIAL ASPHALTIC MATERIALS

17

18

20

19

21

22

TON

TON

TON

FOB Plant Picked Up FOB Plant Picked Up FOB Plant Picked UpFOB Plant Picked Up

Blackstone Technologies

Yes

Payne and Dolan
Vienna Plant

$115.95 $126.95

$115.95 $126.95

$115.95 $126.95

BST-360

No Bid $109.00

BST-360

BST-360

BST-360

No Bid $111.00

No Bid $109.00

BST-360

BST-360

No Bid $108.00

No Bid $108.00

1 Day 1 Business Day

No Bid $114.00 $115.95 $131.95

$115.95 $126.95

$115.95 $126.95

FOB Plant Picked Up

$56.50
$57.50
$58.50
$58.50
$59.50
$60.50
$60.50
$61.50
$63.50
$69.50
$69.50
$69.50
$10.00

$2,500

FOB Plant Picked Up FOB Plant Picked Up FOB Plant Picked Up

$67.45
$67.00
$68.55
$73.70
$73.25
$74.80
No Bid
$79.40
No Bid

$69.00
$70.55
$67.45
$69.00
$70.55

$2,500

$51.33
$55.22
$56.45
$50.09
$53.91
$56.48
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$6.75

$3,500

$67.45$67.45
$67.00
$68.55

FOB Plant Picked Up

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid
$10.00

$2,500

$73.70
$75.25
$76.80
$79.95
$81.40

$10.00

No Bid No Bid


	Summary

