
BID# 116053
Motor Fuels - Gasoline & Diesel

Date: 4/20/2016

DTN Markup Bid Price
Unleaded Reg. Gasoline - Clear UNL 87 + .0115 /gal $0.2095 / gal + .0050 /gal No Bid / gal
Unleaded Reg. Gasoline - Clear 10% ethanol - .0350 / gal $0.1595 / gal - .0385 / gal No Bid / gal
Ultra Low Sulfur #2 Diesel, Undyed, ULS#2 - .0230 / gal $0.1595 / gal - .0196 / gal No Bid / gal
Ultra Low Sulfur #1 Diesel, Undyed, ULS#1 + .0055 / gal $0.2095 / gal - .0340 / gal No Bid / gal
Biodiesel (B100) Ability to supply diff. ratios

Delivery Price Per Location
Madison $0.2250 / gal $0.2300 / gal $0.0230 / gal No Bid / gal
Mt. Horeb $0.0332 / gal $0.2500 / gal $0.0309 / gal No Bid / gal
Springfield $0.0250 / gal $0.2300 / gal $0.0309 / gal No Bid / gal
Stoughton $0.0225 / gal $0.2300 / gal $0.0241 / gal No Bid / gal
Locations of 1,000 gallon portable tanks
Locations of 500 gallon portable tanks

Dane County Tankwagon Pickup Price
Unleaded Reg. Gasoline / gal / gal
Unleaded Reg. Gasoline - 10% ethanol / gal / gal
Ultra Low Sulfur #2 Diesel / gal / gal
Ultra Low Sulfur #1 Diesel / gal / gal

Additional Charges
Winter additive - for -30 F / gal / gal

Premium diesel
Credit for 10 day payment

 Comments

Split a delivery between multiple locations. 
Additional charge for extra stops.

/ gal / 10 days
/ gal

per extra stop

Local Vendor

* included a pickup price

Tankwagon

$0.2000
$0.1900
$0.1900

N/A

BID SUMMARY

Vendor Name:

Transport Tankwagon Transport

TankwagonTransport

Petroleum Traders Corporation

No Bid

$0.005

Transport Tankwagon

YES

Meffert Oil Company

/ gal

$45.00

$0.0300

$0.0300

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

608-266-4131
www.danepurchasing.com

*$35 Pickup
*$35 Pickup

$35 Delivery
$35 Delivery

No Bid
No Bid

Tankwagon Pick Up Tankwagon Pick Up

per extra stop


	4 Vendors

