
1 WisDOT Woven Silt Fence (36"x100') Linear Foot $0.25 $0.25 $0.26 $0.26

Type
Box $30.00 $30.00 $29.00 $29.00

3 Erosion Mat (6-8 foot Width) Square 
Yard

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4 WisDOT Class I, Type A Square 
Yard

100 $0.26 $0.26 100 $0.27 $0.27

5 WisDOT Class I, Type B Square 
Yard

100 $0.29 $0.29 100 $0.28 $0.28

6 WisDOT Urban Class I, Type A Square 
Yard

100 $0.55 $0.55 100 $0.55 $0.55

7 WisDOT Urban Class I, Type B Square 
Yard

100 $0.60 $0.60 100 $0.60 $0.60

8 WisDOT Class II, Type A Square 
Yard

100 $0.86 $0.86 100 $0.69 $0.69

9 WisDOT Class II, Type B Square 
Yard

100 $0.76 $0.76 100 $0.69 $0.69

10 WisDOT Class II, Type C Square 
Yard

120 $2.00 $2.00 120 $2.35 $2.35

11 WisDOT Class III, Type A Square 
Yard

100 $2.35 $2.35 80 $2.35 $2.35

12 WisDOT Class III, Type B Square 
Yard

100 $3.95 $3.95 150 $3.70 $3.70

13 WisDOT Class III, Type C Square 
Yard

100 $4.45 $4.45 100 $4.98 $4.98

14 WisDOT Class III, Type D Square 
Yard

100 $13.00 $13.00 85 $13.00 $13.00

15 Jute Mat (4' Width) Square 
Yard

100 $0.85 $0.85 100 $0.69 $0.69

16
Non-Woven Filter Fabric WisDOT Type 
"R", 15' Width

Square 
Yard

500 0.9 0.9 500 0.89 0.89

17
Non-Woven Filter Fabric WisDOT Type 
"HR", 15' Width

Square 
Yard

500 1.48 1.48 500 1.39 1.39

Type
Square 

Yard
500 0.8 0.8 500 0.79 0.79

Type
Square 

Yard
1.15 0.8 355.3 1.53 1.53

Type
Square 

Yard
0.8 0.8 355.3 0.9 0.9

Type
Square 

Yard
0.8 0.8 355.3 0.83 0.83

Type

Linear Foot 1.78 1.78 100 0.97 0.97

Delivery Days ARO
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Terratex - RX1200 Alliance ILE - Bx Type 2

Terratex - RX1100 Alliance ILE - Bx Type 1

Terratex - RX1100 Alliance ILE - Bx 1515

Resinet - SF50

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

608-266-4131
www.danepurchasing.com

BID SUMMARY
BID #: 118004

Erosion Control Devices            2/8/18

21

48" Heavy Duty Plastic Snow Fence (Green), 
RESINET SF50 or Equal            

Geogrid, Type C                                                 

Geogrid, Type B                                                

Geogrid, Type A                                                 

1 day

20

18

19

6" Wire Products
2

Road Stabilization Fabric (minimum specs) 
Grab Tensile 1300 N Mullen Burst 4100 kPa 
Puncture 530 N               

Terratex - HD Skaps - W315

UOM

Staples, 1,000 per box

Item Description 
Delivered 

Price

Construction Fabrics & Materials 
Corp.

Square 
Yards Per 

Roll

Picked-Up 
Price

Vendor Name:

1-3 business days

Square 
Yards Per 

Roll

Hanes Geo Components

Picked-Up 
Price

Delivered 
Price
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