
BID #116092 - Washer/Dryer/Ozone

QTY Unit ($)

2 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

2 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

1 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

1 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

20 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

19 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

3 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

42 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)

2 Total ($)

QTY Unit ($)
3 Total ($)

COMMENTS Speed Queen Brand Speed Queen Brand
Huebsch Brand - 

Not Speed Queen
-

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$100.00

$4,200.00

$7,725.00

$15,450.00
STT45NQTB2G2W

$7,105.00

$14,210.00

TOTAL COST - Washers and Dryers $88,560.00 $110,569.00 $96,380.00 NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$12,583.00

$12,583.00

COMMENTS - -

TOTAL COST - Ozone Systems NO BID NO BID $18,000.00 $10,950.00

OZONE SYSTEMS

AFL-1
$6,000.00 $3,650.00

$18,000.00 $10,950.00

Aquawing Brand
LUX Brand - Not 

Aquawing

NO BID NO BID

$9,982.00

$19,964.00

Herb Fitzgerald

Yes

$6,150.00

$12,300.00

$265.00

$530.00

$10,000.00

$10,000.00

$335.00

$335.00

$1,775.00

$35,500.00

BDS Laundry 
Systems

Yes

$7,269.00

$14,538.00

$350.00

$700.00

WASHERS AND DRYERS

$385.00

$385.00

$1,973.75

$39,475.00

$763.00

$325.00

$650.00

SCN060KNFX1 
(Quantum Gold)

$8,745.00

$8,745.00

ACBF60X6X110002
$340.00

$340.00

LFNE5BSP113TW01
$1,665.00

$33,300.00

$720.00

Registered

SCN030KNFX1 
(Quantum Gold)

ACBF30X8X110002

BID SUMMARY
DATE: 12/6/2016

 DEPT: Sheriff
CSC ServiceWorksVendor Name:

Yes

$5,135.00

$10,270.00

OMNI Solutions

Yes

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

608-266-4131
www.danepurchasing.com

PDR108W
$120.00

$5,040.00

$14,497.00

$849.00

$2,547.00

LDEE5BGS153TW01

LDGE5BGS113TW01

$815.00

$15,485.00

$860.00

$2,580.00

$13,680.00

$775.00

$2,325.00

$140.00

$5,880.00


	4 Vendors

