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Bid 116012:  Seed, Sod & Topsoil
John Deere Landscapes                              

(aka Site One as of October 19th) La Crosse Seed Reinders Inc.

Opened: February 18, 2016 1385 East 36th St.

Cleveland, OH 44114

Local Address: 8520 Fairway Place   4217 Nakoosa Trail

Middleton, WI  53562

216.706.9250

PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Seed (50 lb. bags) Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered
     WisDOT Mixture # 10 $2.750 $2.750 No Bid No Bid $2.220 $2.320 $2.030 $2.130

     WisDOT Mixture # 20 $2.000 $2.000 No Bid No Bid $1.560 $1.660 $1.410 $1.510

     WisDOT Mixture # 30 $2.450 $2.450 No Bid No Bid $1.870 $1.970 $1.890 $1.990

     WisDOT Mixture # 40 $2.250 $2.250 No Bid No Bid $1.800 $1.900 $1.610 $1.710

     WisDOT Mixture # 60 $2.750 $2.750 No Bid No Bid $2.000 $2.100 $4.630 $4.730

Fertilizer, Type A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 / bag $16.00 / bag $13.15 / bag $14.15 / bag

Fertilizer, Type B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.5 / bag $19.50 / bag $17.05 / bag $18.05 / bag

Terrace Sun Mix $3.250 $3.250 No Bid No Bid $2.200 $2.300 No Bid No Bid

Terrace Shade Mix $2.350 $2.350 No Bid No Bid $1.390 $1.490 No Bid No Bid

     Winter Rye per # $0.350 $0.350 No Bid No Bid $16.95 / bag 56# $17.95 / bag 56# No Bid No Bid

     Winter Wheat per # $0.325 $0.325 No Bid No Bid $16.50 / bag 50# $17.50 / bag 50# No Bid No Bid

Sod

Type:                 Loc:                          . No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type:                 Loc:                          . No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Top Soil, $ per Ton Loaded Not-loaded Loaded CY Not-loaded Loaded Not-loaded Loaded Not-loaded
Shredded No Bid No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Shredded No Bid No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Other:  Soil, Sand, Compost Mixture No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Madison, WI  53714

Keleny Top Soil, Inc

7486 Valley View Rd.

Verona, WI 53593

608.833.4835

W227 N6225 Sussex Rd*

Sussex, WI  53089-3969

262.786.3300

2901 Packer Ave.

Madison, WI 53704

920.980.1625
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