
Qty Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid
50 132.00$         6,600.00$       No Bid  No Bid 99.42$             $      4,971.00  No Bid  No Bid 99.42$             $      4,971.00 116.46$          $      5,823.00 
30  $           34.16 1,024.80$       No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           45.13  $      1,353.90  No Bid  No Bid 
30  $           34.16 1,024.80$       No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           45.13  $      1,353.90  No Bid  No Bid 
0  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
0  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
0  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

60  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $         348.60  $   20,916.00  No Bid  No Bid  $         420.00  $   25,200.00  No Bid  No Bid 
30  $         107.13 3,213.90$       $           95.67  $      2,870.10  $           96.42  $      2,892.60  $         122.50  $      3,675.00  $           95.67  $      2,870.10  $         119.34  $      3,580.20 
50  $         142.84 7,142.00$       $         127.56  $      6,378.00  $         128.56  $      6,428.00  $         163.00  $      8,150.00  $         127.56  $      6,378.00  $         159.12  $      7,956.00 
20  No Bid  No Bid  $           81.30  $      1,626.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           69.84  $      1,396.80  No Bid  No Bid 
20  No Bid  No Bid  $           81.30  $      1,626.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $           69.84  $      1,396.80  No Bid  No Bid 

Chemung Supply Corp. Monroe Truck Equipment

BID SUMMARY
BID# 117077   DEPT: Highway   DATE: 8/17/2017

BID NAME: Snow Plow & Grader Blades

Burke Truck Equipment Valk Manufacturing

Item

Department of Administration
Purchasing Division

608-266-4131
www.danepurchasing.com

Vendor Name: Gray's Inc.
Winter Equipment 

Company

Delivery Time and Future Pricing

5" High 3' Tungsten Carbide Tipped (3/4)
5/8" Black Cat Part# 5614 LH or Equiv
5/8" Black Cat Part# 5614 RH or Equiv
9' Overlay Blades
11' Overlay Blades
3' Joma Blades
4' Joma Blades
6" High 3' Tungsten Carbide Tipped (3/4)
6" High 4' Tungsten Carbide Tipped (3/4)
Joma Part# 663158PRH
Joma Part# 663158PLH

Delivery Time  10-40 days  75-90 days  30 days  30 days 

Comments
November - 10-14 days 

ARO
Non-Locally Operated

Future Pricing Remains the Same Until March 31, 2018 March 2018 December 31, 2017

Locally Based and Owned - 
Low Price Matched

45 days from order December 15, 2017
 14-21 days  30-60 days 


	All Vendors

